

**BID TABULATION
PURCHASE OF SCHOOL BUSES
MAY 2, 2013**

	WOLFINGTON BODY		ALLIANCE BUS GROUP		HOOVER BUS GROUP	
LUMP SUM						
2014						
BASE BID 1 TYPE B	\$57,956.00		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
BASE BID 2 TYPE B	\$57,956.00		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
BASE BID 3 TYPE B	\$57,956.00		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
TOTAL 1-3	\$173,868.00		\$ 163,527.00		NO BID	
2014						
BASE BID 4 TYPE C	\$90,697.00		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
BASE BID 5 TYPE C	\$90,697.00		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
BASE BID 6 TYPE C	\$90,697.00		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
TOTAL 4-6	\$272,091.45		NO BID		\$266,760.00	
2015						
BASE BID 7 TYPE B	NO BID		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
BASE BID 8 TYPE B	NO BID		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
BASE BID 9 TYPE B	NO BID		\$54,509.00		NO BID	
TOTAL 7 - 9	NO BID		\$163,527.00		NO BID	
2015						
BASE BID 10 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
BASE BID 11 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
BASE BID 12 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$88,920.00	
TOTAL 10-12	NO BID		NO BID		\$266,760.00	

**BID TABULATION
PURCHASE OF SCHOOL BUSES
MAY 2, 2013**

	WOLFINGTON BODY		ALLIANCE BUS GROUP		HOOVER BUS GROUP	
LEASE/PURCHASE	Annual	5-Year	Annual	5-Year	Annual	5-Year
2014						
ALT. BID 1 TYPE B 2014	\$12,059.00	\$60,295.00	\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
ALT. BID 2 TYPE B 2014	\$12,059.00	\$60,295.00	\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
ALT. BID 3 TYPE B 2014	\$12,059.00	\$60,295.00	\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
TOTAL 1-3		\$180,885.00	\$34,653.79	\$173,268.96	NO BID	
2014						
ALT. BID 4 TYPE C	\$18,871.00	\$94,355.00	NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
ALT. BID 5 TYPE C	\$18,871.00	\$94,355.00	NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
ALT. BID 6 TYPE C	\$18,871.00	\$94,355.00	NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
TOTAL 4-6		\$283,065.00	NO BID			\$279,294.30
2015						
ALT. BID 7 TYPE B	NO BID		\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
ALT. BID 8 TYPE B	NO BID		\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
ALT. BID 9 TYPE B	NO BID		\$11,551.26	\$57,756.32	NO BID	
TOTAL 7 - 9	NO BID		\$34,653.79	\$173,268.96	NO BID	
2015						
ALT. BID 10 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
ALT. BID 11 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
ALT. BID 12 TYPE C	NO BID		NO BID		\$18,619.62	\$93,098.10
TOTAL 10-12	NO BID		NO BID			\$279,294.30